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31 1 2 3 4 5 6

Pray for the churches 
that partner with 
Eagle Village. That 
their ministry would 
be powerful. 

Pray for the team of 
Therapists who help 
kids change!

Pray for the residents 
and staff at the 
Assessment Center. 

Pray that chapel 
content today would 
be well received and 
life changing. 

Pray for Eagle Village 
leadership as they 
continue navigating 
through uncertainty. 

Pray for the residents 
and staff at Gerber 
House. 

Pray that campus 
activities would be 
meaningful and safe 
today.  

7 8 9 10 11 12 13

Pray that residents 
would make the 
decision to 
participate in church 
today. 

Pray for the residents 
and staff at Ashmun 
House. 

Pray for Residential 
Supervisors who 
oversee residential 
houses. 

Pray that chapel via 
video today would 
give residents and 
staff a better 
understanding of God 
.

Pray for God’s 
blessing on Eagle 
Village. 

Pray for the residents 
and staff at Sherk 
House. 

Pray for the team of 
Experiential 
Specialists who 
invest in residents 
day after day. 

14 15 16 17 18 19 20

Pray that God would 
use church today to 
be transformational in 
the lives of residents 
and staff. 

Pray for the 
continued impact of 
the Eagle Village 
Camp even through 
uncertainty. 

Pray for the residents 
and staff at Hainley 
House. 

Pray that God would 
make himself known 
to each person during 
chapel time today. 

Pray for continued 
creativity for staff 
across campus. 

Pray that God’s Spirit 
would fill each Eagle 
Village staff person. 

Pray that this 
weekend would be 
active and refreshing 
for residents and 
staff. 
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Pray that staff would 
be encouraged as 
they facilitate 
livestream church in 
the house today. 

Pray for the residents 
and staff at Leppien 
House. 

Pray for new Eagle 
Village employees 
who join the team 
and make a 
difference. 

Pray that residents 
would make the 
decision to 
participate in chapel 
today. 

Pray for the Adoption 
and Foster Care Team 
and the important 
impact they make. 

Pray for the residents 
and staff at Putnam 
House. 

Pray for God to be 
very active on 
campus today. 
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Pray for lives to be 
changed during 
church today. 

Pray for Eagle Village 
foster parents and 
families. 

Pray that Eagle 
Village staff would 
have a powerful 
connection to the EV 
mission. 

Pray that residents 
would experience 
God today during 
chapel time. 

Pray for the 
Community Based 
Services team as they 
continue to invest in 
our community. 

Pray for residents to 
stay strong and 
continue progressing 
academically. 

Pray that God would 
continue to guide 
Eagle Village. 

Through God’s help and love, Eagle 
Village serves, values, and equips 
children and families for success. 

Thank your for your continued support of Eagle Village. 


